Price County Timber Sale Bid Results -- December 7, 2022

*denotes successful bidder

Wiitalaand | Stella-Jones Biewer WI

Tract 6-23 Vozka Corp Sawmill
Mx Hwd 140[tons| $9.00 $14.00 $s.00 $0.00
Aspen 525[tons| $13.00 $18.00 $15.00 $15.93
Spruce 60[tons| $11.00 $18.00 $15.00 $20.00
Red Pine 1,850|tons| $17.00 $42.00 $46.32 $40.43
White Pine 850!tons| $8.00 $28.00 $16.50 $17.81
Balsam Fir 25|tons| $4.00 $10.00 $4.00 $4.00

Total Bid $43,605.00] $105,840.00 | $100,588.00 $92,601.25

Schloer Futurewood Fink Forest | Wiitala and

Tract 16-23 e WT Logging Products Vozka
Aspen 1,250|tons 1800|tons $13.00 $29.33 $21.39 $15.10 $18.50
Mx Hwd 130jtons 160|tons $9.00 $10.00 $9.33 $10.00 $12.00
Balsam Fir 25]tens 25]tons $4.00 $4.00 $4.37 $4.00 $10.00

Total Bid $17,520.00 $38,062.50 $28,059.85 $25,860.00 $24,935.00
Tract 17-23
Mxd Hwd 2,300|tons |  $8.00 NO BID
Aspen 25|tons | $13.00
Basswood 130|tons | §3.00
Maple Logs 100|MBF| $240.00
Mx Hwd Logs 40|mMBF| $140.00
Red Cak Logs 3{mBF| $240.00
Mx Hwd Bolts 70]eords] $30.00

Total Bid $51,635.00] #VALUE]
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*denotes successful bidder

Tract 18-23
Mx Hwd 1,700 tons|  $7.00 NO BID
Aspen 10 tons| $12.00
Balsam 85 tons| $4.00
Mx Hwd Logs 10 MBF| $140.00
Maple Logs 30 MBF| $240.00
Mx Hwd Bolts 70 cords| $30.00
Total Bid §23,060.00]  #VALUE!
Kestler Bruce
Logyging Inc Burmeister Futurewood
Tract 19-23
Aspen 1,100 tons| $13.00 $16.00 $14.25 $14.16
Ix Hwd 90 tons| $7.00 $10.00 $10.00 $7.07
Total Bid $14,930.00] $18,500.00 $16,575.00 $16,212.30
Kestler Bruce
Logging Inc Futurewood Burmeister
Tract 20-23
Aspern _ ‘__moo_azw $13.00 $16.00 §14.16 $13.65
Total Bid $16,600.00]  $19,200.00 $16,992.00 $16,260.00
Tract 21-23
Mx Hwd Pulp 575 tons| $9.00 NO BID
Aspen 3,600 tons) $13.00
Mx Bolts 15 cordsf $30.00
Total Bid $62,425.00] #VALUE!
Kestler R.M. Bay
Tract 2223 Logging Inc | Logging Inc
Aspen 1,650 tons] $13.00 $18.00 $17.00
Mx Hwt 26 tonsf  $9.00 $11.00 $9.00
Total Bid $21,675.00] $29,975.00 $28,275.00
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Wiitala and

Tract 23-23 Vozka
Aspen 1,800 tons| $13.00 $16.00
Mx Hwd 75 tons| $9.00 $11.00
Balsam Fir 25 wns | $4.00 $10.00

Total Bid $24,175.00]  $29,875.00

[ Wiitala and |

Tract 24-23 Vozka
Aspen 2,100 tons| $13.00 $14.50
Mx Hwd 300 tons| $9.00 $11.00

Total Bid $30,000.00] $33,750.00
Tract 25-23
Mx Hwd Pulp 2,150|tons| $7.00 no bid
Basswood Pulp 450(tons| $3.00
Mx Bolts 200]cords| $30.00
Maple L.ogs 82|MBF| $240.00
Mx Logs 157IMBF| $140.00

Total Bid $64,080.00] #VALUEI

Schloer Fink Forest Wiitala and

Tract 26-23 4" top wt Logging Products Futurewood Vozka
Mx Hwd 70)icns 90 $9.00 $9.00 $10.00 $9.13 $12.00
Aspen 1,550|tong| 2000 $13.00 $24.00 $16.10 $19.63 $14.00

Total Bid $20,780.00 $37,830.00 $33,100.00 $31,065.60 $22,540.00

R.M. Bay Wiitala and

Tract 27.23 Logging Inc Vozka
Aspen 2,600(tons] $12.00 $17.50 $14.50
iMx Hwd 570|tons| $7.00 $7.50 $11.00
Mx Hwd Bolts 10]corss | $24.90 $40.00 $25.00
Mx Hwd Logs 10{MBF| $140.00 $140.00 $160.00
Maple Logs 10[MBF| $240.00 $275.00 $250.00

Total Bid $39,239.00] $54,325.00 $48,320.00




